
Manchester Public Works FRAMES/GRATES
FY19 - 500 - 46

Spring Bids

Frames Grates Bid Opening:  3/29/2019

PRODUCT E. J. Prescott Core & Main Ferguson F. W. Webb

4” C.I. Frame for CB Grate, Type B, 4 flange $115.79 $113.41 $131.67 $136.00
4” C.I. Frame for CB Grate, Type B, 3 flange $115.79 $111.35 $124.81 $136.00
8" C.I. Frame for CB Grate, 3 flange $126.33 $137.89 $139.63 $145.00
8" C.I. Frame for Grate, Type F, 3 flange $203.15 $203.61 $189.36 $199.00
6” C.I. Frame for 30” dia. Manhole Cover $124.08 $118.56 $139.68 $146.00
4” C.I. Frame for 30” dia. Manhole Cover $118.68 $149.49 $154.26 $173.00
6” C.I. Frame for 24” dia. Manhole Cover $124.07 $129.90 $163.09 No Bid
4” C.I. Frame for 24” dia. Manhole Cover $118.68 $98.97 No Bid No Bid

Cast Iron C.B. Grate, Type B $76.84 $85.57 $86.01 $89.83
Cast Iron C.B. Grate, Type F $152.63 $154.64 $148.94 $169.00

30” dia. Manhole Cover $151.05 $175.26 $163.72 $171.00
24” dia. Manhole Cover $110.05 $106.16 $123.99 No Bid

SET:  6" C.I Frame for 30" dia Grated Cover No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polyethylene Catch Basin Liner $95.00 $149.99 $135.00 $130.00

Manhole Riser Ring, 24” dia. X 1” ht. $104.21 $117.03 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 24” dia. x 1 ½” ht. $114.18 $122.35 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 24” dia. X 2” ht. $127.38 $127.66 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 26” dia. X 1” ht. $130.84 $127.66 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 26” dia. X 1 ½” ht. $131.99 $136.18 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 26” dia. X 2” ht. $133.16 $141.49 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 32” dia. X 1” ht. $122.74 $154.26 No Bid No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 32” dia. X 1 ½” ht. $127.37 $164.90 $158.51 No Bid
Manhole Riser Ring, 32” dia. X 2” ht. $138.95 $175.54 $173.40 No Bid

Catch Basin Riser, 2’ x 2’, 1” ht. $125.38 $111.71 No Bid No Bid
Catch Basin Riser, 2’ x 2’, 1 ½” ht. $133.21 $117.03 No Bid No Bid
Catch Basin Riser, 2’ x 2’, 2” ht. $143.56 $127.66 No Bid No Bid

Request minimum delivery $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Restocking Fees 0% 0% 0% 0%
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