
City of Manchester Spring Bids  2007

Brook Hollow Brox Manchester Sand Plourde F. L. Merill Pike Industries
Sand & Gravel & Gravel

Price w/delivery (per ton) Price w/delivery (per ton) Price w/delivery (per ton) Price w/delivery (per ton) Price w/delivery (per ton) Price w/delivery (per ton)

Product

Washed Sand no bid 10.75$                  10.75$                     9.50$                     no bid no bid

1/2" Stone no bid 10.75$                  13.25$                     10.80$                   no bid 12.25$                  

3/4" Stone 12.00$                     10.50$                  12.50$                     10.80$                   no bid 10.75$                  

1 1/2" Stone 11.00$                     10.50$                  12.25$                     10.60$                   no bid 10.50$                  

6" - 12" Stone Fill no bid 10.50$                  11.25$                     11.35$                   17.05$                    10.95$                  

Sandfill 6.80$                       6.45$                    6.25$                       5.30$                     7.00$                     no bid

Loam no bid 14.40$                  11.75$                     14.10$                   15.55$                    13.00$                  

Gravel Bank Run 9.00$                       8.50$                    9.00$                       $8.08 $8.55 no bid

Gravel Crushed Bank Run 10.00$                     8.50$                    10.00$                     $10.50 $11.05 no bid

Crushed Gravel* $10.50 9.50$                    

Delivery 3.05 3 3.25$                       3.00$                     4.80$                     3.00$                    

Bids awarded to highlighted vendors.

Vendors

Aggregates - Delivery 4/4/2007


