
Manchester Public Works AGGREGATES
FY19-500-48

Spring Bids

Aggregates Bid Opening:  3/28/2019

Pike Brox

Gravel Bank Run  no bid no bid

Crushed Gravel $7.75 $7.00

304.4 CSFG

Gravel Crushed Bank Run no bid no bid

Screened Gravel $13.00 no bid

Washed Sand  no bid $15.00

1/2" Stone  $17.50 $10.00

3/4" Stone  $11.35 $12.00

1 1/2" Stone  $11.35 $12.00

6" - 12" Stone Fill  $13.00 $12.00

Sandfill  no bid $7.50

Loam (Class A)  no bid $15.50

DELIVERY QUOTE/TON $5.50 $5.50

*  Gravel Bank Run and Gravel Crushed Bank Run will be 
purchased through Plourde Sand & Gravel

VENDORS
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